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The Menominee County Board of Road Commissioners held a PUBLIC HEARING in their offices 

north of Stephenson on Tuesday, April 9, 2013. 

 

Chair Kakuk called the hearing to order at 8:45 a.m. with the following persons present or absent: 

 

Present: Roger Betzinger, Anthony Kakuk, Darrell Moilanen and Lisa Savord.  Also present were 

Dave Hopps, Scott Porta, Brad Cousins, John Perras, Cliff Perras, Joe Skrobiak, Chuck Behrend, 

Larry Barker, Randall Phillipps, Bonnie Nyquist, Gerald Piche, Sheriff Kenny Marks, and Joe 

Linder. 

 

Absent: William Anderson. 

 

The Pledge of Allegiance was recited. 

 

Kakuk turned the meeting over to Moilanen who explained that a valid abandonment petition had 

been received and the purpose of the hearing was to hear interested parties for or against the 

abandonment of that Part of No. 36 Lane, commencing at 1.0 miles west of the centerline of the N-1 

[Frenchtown] Road; thence 0.6 miles west between Section 34, T.38N. - R.27W. in Meyer Township 

and Section 3, T.37N. - R. 27W. in Nadeau Township; thence 1.0 miles through the west half of 

Section 3, T.37N. - R.27W. in Nadeau Township, Menominee County, Michigan.    

 

Randall Phillipps introduced himself as the attorney for the abandonment petitioner, David Hopps. 

Mr. Phillipps presented the board with a booklet outlining the reasons that the abandonment was 

being requested, which include a high crime rate in the area (break-ins and excessive littering and 

trash disposal).  Also addressed in the handout were issues that had been brought up at a prior 

abandonment hearing for this road such as access for fire and public safety officials, the amount of 

public support for the proposed abandonment and legal access for all landowners adjacent to the 

road.  Betzinger asked if easements had been granted to all landowners affected by the proposed 

abandonment.  Mr. Phillipps replied that the easements had already granted and recorded at the 

county courthouse.  Kakuk asked if the easements would extend to all future successors.  Mr. 

Phillipps responded that they would. 

 

Betzinger asked if the landowners were aware that if the road were abandoned, that it would no 

longer be maintained by the road commission, and that all future plowing, culvert maintenance and 

repairs would fall to the landowners at their expense.  Mr. Phillipps stated that the landowners were 

aware of this. 

 

John Perras addressed the board and also provided a handout outlining the history of the land 

ownership along the road, past criminal activity in the area and public support for the abandonment. 

 

John Nerat, Darlene Nerat and Glen Havelka joined the hearing at 9:01 a.m. 

 

Moilanen called three times for any further comments about the proposed Abandonment of a portion 

of No. 36 Lane.  There being none, the hearing was closed at 9:06 a.m. 
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The Menominee County Board of Road Commissioners held a regular meeting in their offices north 

of Stephenson on Tuesday, April 9, 2013 immediately following the Public Hearing.  

 

Additions to agenda - None. 

 

Public comments – David Hopps advised the board that there no longer were any public property or 

CFR lands adjacent to the portion of No. 36 Lane that he is asking to be abandoned.  Betzinger asked 

if the public receives notice when property changes from CFR to private ownership.  Randall 

Phillipps responded that there is no public notice given and the change is only reflected when the 

plat book is updated. 

 

Public appearances – None. 
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Additions/corrections to minutes for 03/12/13, 03/14/13 and 04/03/13 –There being no additions or  

corrections, Kakuk declared that the minutes will stand as written.  

 

Financial Report –   

 
 

There being no questions or comments, Kakuk declared the financial report accepted as read. 

 

Vouchers # 13-0030, 13-0031, 13-0033, 13-0331, and 13-0034 – Moved by Betzinger, seconded by 

Kakuk that the vouchers be approved and ordered paid. Carried unanimously. 

 

Open bids for 2013 Culvert needs – Bids were opened and read aloud as follows: 

  

 UP Concrete Pipe, Escanaba, MI  Total bid $81,186.75 

  

 Contech Construction Products, Kimberly, WI     Total bid $75,847.50 

  

 Jenson Bridge & Supply, Sandusky, MI         No Bid Submitted 

  

 St. Regis Culvert, Inc., Charlotte, MI         Total bid $114,038.40 

 

Moved by Betzinger, seconded by Kakuk to have the bids tabulated and checked for irregularities, 

with the award to be made at an upcoming special meeting. Carried unanimously. 

 

Open bids for Gravel Crushing – Bids were opened and read aloud as follows: 

 

 R. Wells Contracting Corp, Gladstone, MI  No bid 

  

 Iron City Enterprises, Menominee, MI  Area 1: $2.35/ton 

    Area 2: $3.28/ton 

    Area 3: $2.38/ton 

 

 Payne & Dolan, Gladstone, MI  No Bid 

 

 To-Ne-Hil Farms, LLC, Daggett, MI  Area 1: No Bid 

    Area 2: $5.90/ton 

    Area 3: No Bid 

  

Receipts Expenditures

Payables / 

Reserves Balances

Balance, March 11, 2013 $1,320,101.19

Receipts thru 03/31/13 187,383.76

Expenditures thru 03/31/13 288,891.16

Balance, March 31, 2013 1,218,593.79   

Michigan Transportation Funds 357,681.02

Receipts thru 04/08/13 59,918.40

Expenditures thru 04/08/13 6,618.24

State Maint. & Equip. Advances 142,930.00

Balance, April 08, 2013 604,983.18 295,509.40 142,930.00 1,486,644.97   

Payables & Reserves

Payroll 04/11, and 04/25 (Est.) 130,000.00

Soc. Sec. 04/11 and 04/25 (Est.) 9,945.00

Reserve for workers compensation insurance 13,462.38

Reserve for liability insurance 143,692.00

Reserve for rental grader lease (Dec 2009) 36,798.06

Reserve for rental grader leases (Oct 2010) 193,071.96

Reserve for F-4 Lane bridge (Harris Twp) 575.25

Reserve for design of River Drive 2,960.00

Reserve for Mussel Surveys on bridges 7,250.00

Reserve for Forest Funds 161,015.11

Reserve for 2013 Federal Aid match 69,145.00 (767,914.76)     

718,730.21$    
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 Northstar Crushing & Screening, Gladstone, MI Area 1: $4.25/ton 

    Area 2: $3.52/ton 

    Area 3: $3.10 /ton 

  

 Havelka Construction, Wallace, MI  Area 1: $3.50/ton 

    Area 2: $4.50/ton 

    Area 3: $4.00/ton  

 

Moved by Betzinger, seconded by Kakuk to have the bids tabulated and checked for irregularities, 

with the award to be made at an upcoming special meeting. Carried unanimously. 

 

Act on proposed abandonment of a portion of No. 36 Lane – Moilanen stated that a public hearing 

on the requested abandonment had been held earlier in the morning. It was noted that copies of 

easements for all properties adjacent to the proposed abandonment had been executed and filed at 

the county courthouse.  All those with comments at the Public Hearing were for the abandonment.  

No one spoke against the proposed abandonment. 

 

It was moved by Commissioner Betzinger that the following resolution be adopted: 

 
  WHEREAS, a petition has been received requesting the absolute abandonment and 

discontinuance of a certain road in Meyer and Nadeau Townships described as follows: That Part of 
No. 36 Lane, commencing at 1.0 miles west of the centerline of the N-1 [Frenchtown] Road; thence 
0.6 miles west between Section 34, T.38N. - R.27W. in Meyer Township and Section 3, T.37N. - R. 
27W. in Nadeau Township; thence 1.0 miles through the west half of Section 3, T.37N. - R.27W. in 
Nadeau Township. 
 

 Said petition having been signed by 7 or more freeholders in the Township of Meyer and 7 or 

more freeholders in the Township of Nadeau. 

 

 AND WHEREAS a Public Hearing was held at 8:45 a.m., April 9, 2013 and it has been 

determined that it is in the best interest of the public that said road shall be absolutely abandoned and 

discontinued. 

 

 NOW, THEREFORE, pursuant to MCLA 224.18, MSA 9.118, the Board of Menominee 

County Road Commissioners does absolutely abandon and discontinue forever said road, reserving, 

however, a ten (10) foot easement on either side of all existing public utilities forever. 

 

This resolution was supported by Commissioner Kakuk and carried by the following vote:     

Ayes   2  ; Nays    0    . 

 

Dave Hopps, Randall Phillipps, Scott Porta, Brad Cousins, John Perras, Cliff Perras, and Sheriff 

Kenny Marks left the meeting at 9:29 a.m. 

 

Discuss request from Menominee Conservation District to use road commission facilities for their 

annual tree sale – Moilanen explained that the conservation district had used the road commission’s 

cold storage building for the past several years and that there had never been any problems. Moved 

by Betzinger, seconded by Kakuk to allow the use of the building as requested. Carried 

unanimously. 

  

Discuss road commission / township cost share for construction projects – Moilanen stated that the 

board had committed to the Spring Green Road and CR356 projects in the prior year and no changes 

to the cost share would be made.  

 

Possible upcoming projects are a grade lift in the swamp area of CR338, Bay de Noc Road from 48
th

 

Ave. to Evergreen, pulverize & double chip seal N-2 Lane north of Linsmeier Road, and Old US 2 in 

Harris Township. It was moved by Betzinger, seconded by Kakuk to do a 50/50 cost share with the 

townships for N-2 Lane ship seal preparation and CR338 paving preparation. Other projects will be 

evaluated in the next fiscal year beginning 10/01/13. Carried unanimously. 

 

Discuss/approve CRAM annual membership invoice – Moved by Kakuk, seconded by Betzinger to 

continue membership in CRAM and pay the invoice in the amount of $6,324.  Carried unanimously. 

 

Any other business – Moilanen requested permission to assign an adjustment to the urban boundary  
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near the Menominee city limits.  Moved by Betzinger, seconded by Kakuk to allow the change.  

Carried unanimously. 

 

Moilanen stated that he had received three RFP’s for the 2013 bridge inspections as follows: 

 Ayres & Associates $11,360.00 

 UP Engineers & Architects $24,850.00 

 AECOM $19,250.00 

Moved by Kakuk, seconded by Betzinger to award the work to Ayres & Associates.  Carried 

unanimously. 

 

Moilanen asked the board to consider holding a special meeting within the next two weeks to award 

the bids for gravel crushing and culverts.  The commissioners will check their availability and advise 

Savord of a date for the meeting. 

 

Betzinger asked Moilanen if he used TEDF funds to pay for any of the road projects.  Moilanen 

stated that there were different types of TEDF funds available and they could only be used for 

specific purposes.  Category A can be used if there is a documented business expansion on the road 

creating more jobs, Category D funds are for upgrades to All Season roads and Category F funds can 

be used in urban areas only.  

 

Betzinger asked about the condition of the steamers used to open plugged culverts.  Moilanen stated 

that only 2 of the 3 steamers are useable.  A new steamer had been demonstrated and its cost would 

be approximately $10,000.  Since the steamers only get used for 2-3 weeks each year it was hoped 

that we can get by with just the two for this year.  Other major capital expenditures that may take 

precedent over the steamer are the replacement of the old heating boiler in the Stephenson shop, 

replacement of the old furnaces in the office to high efficiency units and the purchase of a retriever 

for the grader.  Kakuk asked when Moilanen would have a cost of the retriever.  Moilanen replied 

that he hoped to have all the necessary information prepared for the upcoming special meeting. 

 

Menominee County Commissioner Gerald Piche stated that he had attended Faithorn Township’s 

monthly meeting and that the township supervisor was very complimentary regarding the three way 

funding program.  Mr. Piche also passed on a request the culvert on Bird No. 36 Road be checked 

for damage.  Moilanen will look at this. 

 

Public Comment – Nadeau Township Supervisor Joe Linder asked if there was any gravel left in the 

Kraniak pit.  Moilanen stated that there was not.  The only gravel that the road commission has at 

this time is in the Koss, Lucas and Bellefeuil pits.  Mr. Linder asked when Moilanen could be 

available to ride along with him to look at 3-4 roads in Nadeau Township.  The two decided to meet 

later today.  Mr. Linder asked if the type of gravel that was used on K-3 Lane last year could be used 

on other roads.  Moilanen replied that there was only a limited supply of the crushed limestone in the 

county.  Glen Havelka added that there was none available on the north end of the county.  Mr. 

Linder asked if the road commission policy was still going to be that the township pays for the cost 

of the gravel and the road commission absorbs the cost to place it on the roads.  Moilanen replied 

that this policy was still in place. 

 

Glen Havelka asked if he could have permission to cut the brush on the north side of 48
th

 Avenue 

prior to the M-35 project this year.  Moilanen stated that the City of Menominee had jurisdiction in 

that area per an agreement that has been in place for a number of years. 

 

Closed session to discuss Teamsters Local 406 wage reopener proposal – Moved by Betzinger, 

seconded by Kakuk to move to closed session at 9:55 a.m.  Carried unanimously. 

 

Moved by Kakuk, seconded by Betzinger to return to open session at 10:21 a.m.  Carried 

unanimously. 

 

Moved by Kakuk, seconded by Betzinger to authorize Moilanen to present a proposal to Local 406 

officials.  Carried unanimously. 

 

There being no further business, Kakuk declared the meeting adjourned at 10:22 a.m.  
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