Menominee County E-9-1-1 Governing Board

Mark Petersen — Chairman Carl Johnson — Vice-Chairman Sharline Corrigan — Secretary/Treasurer

June 10, 2015

Dear Members:

Please be informed that a meeting of the Menominee County E-9-1-1 Governing Board is scheduled for
Tuesday, June 16", 2015 at 6:30 PM at the City of Stephenson City Hall.

AGENDA

1. Approval of agenda

Minutes of previous meeting.

Public comment — agenda items only.
Weather Notifications (Paging).

Radio console replacement and funding.

JS Electronics.

L o R

Director's Report.

a) Digital Recorder Bids.

b) Hannahville Grant.

c) 800 MHZ Console Info.

d) Textto 9-1-1.

e) Hiring Process.

f) CAD/AVL Presentation.

g) Training.

8. Public Comment

9. Next Meeting Date. September 15, 2015?

10. Adjournment.



FW: Message from KMBT_423

From: Debra Wormwood <DWormwood@Menomineeco.com>

To: Brett Botbyl <bbotbvl@citvofmenominee.net>. Brian Bousley <bbousley@Menomineeco.com>, Brian White <bfwsfd07@gmail.com>, Carl Johnson work

<plazaace-carl@new.rr.com>, ...D Hammerberg <hammerbergd@michigan.gov>, Dan Hammerberg <hammer8@earthlink.net>, David LeBoeuf

<davidleb56@hotmail.com>, Gerrv Christiaens <upnorth1990@o|bb us> Greq Cunmnqham <CunninghamG@michigan.gov>, J|m Gardiner <jgardiner-

firechief@stephenson-mi.com>, "Josh Jones (jkjonesmi

, Ken Marks <KMarks@Menomineeco.com>, Mark Petersen

<mpetersen@cityofmenominee.net>, Mike Orlando <mor|and0@BAMC org>, Robin Halfadav <rha|fadav@h|cpd org>, Shar Corrigan

<emtsdc@hotmail.com>, Sherry DuPont <SDuPont@menomineeco.com>, William Cech <wcech@Menomineeco.com>

Date: 05/04/15 21:08

| received the attached letter from Jim Swanson last week.

| am not sure who contacted him, but the information these people shared with Jim

is not accurate.

The only retirement | mentioned was my own.

Someone did ask me if Jim was retiring, and | do recall saying | didn’t know but | thought
his daughter was still in school.

| also experienced a similar situation with Chris Poupore from Nadeau Fire Dept. and
Tom Philipps from Mid County Rescue saying they were told the radio console’s at 9-1-1
were full and could not accommodate more pager codes.

| just wanted to inform the Governing Board members of this issue.

Thanks, Debra

From: bizhub@ menominee.county.local [mailto:bizhub@ menominee.county.local]
Sent: Friday, May 01, 2015 11:08 AM

To: Debra Wormwood
Subject: Message from KMBT_423

E SKMBT_42315050111070.pdf




* TWO WAY RADIO
* SYSTEM DESIGN
‘ * EMERGENCY VEHICLE LIGHTING AND INSTALLS

ELECTRONICS * FCC APPLICATIONS AND LICENSING

Aprif 29, 2015

Ms. Debra Wormwood, Director
Menominee County 9-1-1

2509 Tenth Street

Menominee, Michigan 49858

Debra,

In the past several weeks | have had numerous individuals stop by my office and ask me if  am,
indeed, retiring or when | am retiring. Each time the source of this question has been traced
back to you and remarks you made at the latest 9-1-1 Governing Board Committee meeting.

We have recently invested tens of thousands of dollars in upgrades to the shop as well as
equipment and training, taking on several new lines of radio, CCTV, and public safety
equipment in addition to those we have represented for many years. As our product line grows
and our services evolve and expand we are looking forward to the next decade in business.

| am unsure where you received the fallacious information that | was planning on retiring as it
most certainly was not from me or Denise. Perhaps you just assumed | would retire in the near
future and felt it appropriate to share your assumptions with others in a manner that came
across as fact. | cannot stress strongly enough my displeasure with your comments and the
great potential for a negative impact on my business because of them.

I respectfully request you immediately cease spreading this erroneous information and correct
your previous comments to other committee members who may be sharing this fabricated
information. | will not hesitate to take further action if this issue is not resolved promptly and to
my satisfaction.

Sincerely,
QZM
James E. Swanson
cc: Brian Bousley, Menominee Co. Administrator

Legal file
9-1-1 file

Telecommunications Systems Sales and Service

1108 20th Street - Menominee, MI 49858 + 906-863-2820 « www.jselectronics.net



Quote Number: 2015175

Quality Recording Solutions, LLC
780 Kingridge Drive
OSARNE Roswell, Georgia 30075

Tel: 770-993-4793 Fax: 770-993-5038 e ‘-
Prepared for: |Menominee Co 911 ' "'
Aftn: Debra Wormwood |I Il

2508 10th Street
Menominee, Ml 49853

=

L =

Hardware/Software

Model No. Description Unit | QTY | Total Price
NexLog 740 |Eventide NexLog 740 24Ch Voice Logger $7.485 1 $7.495
DVD Drive, Hot Swap 1TB RAID1, Dual Hot Swappable Power Supplies,
105301 Integraied 7 Color LCD Touch Screen Display $1.024 1 $1,024
105284-016 [18-Channel Analog Card, 18 Ch. Licenses $3,700 1 $3,700
271052 Internal IP Recorder w/ 8 Channel Licenses for VolP $3,950 1 $3,950
271066 NG811 SIPREC License $1,995 1 $1,995
271083 MediaWorks Pius: Concurrent Access for 8 Users $995 1 $995
25PAC 25 Pair Amphenol Cable $50 1 $50
USB 16GB USB Flash Drive 1 $0
Hardware/Software Sub-Total $19,209
‘Services | ' | Rate | QTY| Total Price
IT Installation and Training $2.250 1 $2,250
Services Price .. 220
S ofh e _gaosifal oSl ekl BET o L = LT S R R e VR 3 e |
Price
System Price _ ) $19,209
Services Price $2,250
Shipping - o $125
Tax $0
Total Price $21,584
Price quotation doas not include sales tax. These amounts will be added to the involce amount as applicable.
Other Conditions of Sale: ____ N Quote Expires in 90 Days

installation to be provided by QRS to customer installed RJ21X or 66 Block

Customer Is responsible for installation of RJ21X or 66 Block within 6 fect of the recorder for telephone, radic and electrical connections prior to installation by QRS.
Customer is responsible for programing VolP/RolP swilch to deliver the necessary audio and data to the recorder prior to installation by QRS. Additional charges may apply if
the VolP codec is anything other than G.711 PCM codec
Price includes one year warranty on parts
Service If needed may be obtained by calling (877) 733-7770 ext. 702
Software upgrades furnished at no charge while under service contract with QRS
Equipment will be ordered and installed 30 days ARO unless agreed upon other wise, in which a written letter with requested install date will be required
Payment terms are net 30 days from invoice / installation
If the end user is not ready for the installation on the agreed upon date, the system will be shipped 1o end user and an invoice will be sent for 50% of total purchase price.
Upon completion of the install and training, the remaining balance will be invoiced.
Accepted By:

 Signature:

Name & Title:

Date:




BIS Digital

Integrating Excellence™

Business Information Systems, Inc
1350 NE 56" Street, Suite 300 = Ft. Lauderdale, FL 33334
Phone: (800) 834-7674 = Fax: (877) 858-5611

Date Thursday, May 21, 2015
Quote Number Q-8009265-5.21.2015

Sales Consultant  Andy Spigner
(800) 834-7674 x4044 / andy spigner@bisdigital.com

Primary Contact Debra Wormwood, Director
2509 10th Street
Menominee, MI 49858
(906) 863-6614 / (906) 863-7704 (Fax)
dwormwood@menomineeco.com (Email)

Billing Address Menominee County Central Dispatch / A-1002966
2509 10th Street
Menominee, MI 49858

Shipping Address Same

Users To Train Yes

Wiring Required  Yes

Notes: Revcord system will record a total of 16 Analog lines and 4 SIP trunk
telephone lines. System includes hardware, software, onsite installation,

training and one year onsite service. IMPORTANT: additional
information may be needed for SIP lines.

Item Code Qty | Unit Price Total Price
16¢ch Analog Tower Chassis BIS-REV- 1 $7.655.00 $7.655.00
TCA-16

Software For Permanent VolP/RolP Channels - | BIS-REV- 5 $373.75 $1,868.75
Per Channel SW-PMT

On-site Setup, Installation and Training SIT 2 $1,350.00 $2,700.00

Sales Tax Rate %

Total (Excluding Sales Tax) $12,223.75

1350 NE 56™ Street ~Suite 300 - Fort Lauderdale, FL 33434 . Fax: (877) 858-5611




BIS Digital 3EI,

Integrating Excellence™

Business Information Systems, Inc
1350 NE 56t Street, Suite 300 = Ft. Lauderdale, FL 33334
Phone: {800) 834-7674 = Fax: {877) 858-5611

Order Summary

Date Thursday, May 21, 2015

Quote Number Q-8009265-5.21.2015

Account Name Menominee County Central Dispatch
Total (Excluding Sales Tax) | $12,223.75

Terms and Conditions

Effective Period This proposal is a firm offer for 30 days from quote date Thursday, May 21, 2015.

Tax Status Sales tax will be added to invoice unless Tax Exempt Form is on file with BIS Digital.

Payment Terms Deposit: All orders above $5,000 require a 50% deposit. Once the order and deposit is
confirmed {received} by BIS Digital, scheduling of the installation / and shipment of
goods will occur.

Balance: The remaining balance is to be paid on the completion of the installation.
{delivery of goods at customer site}

Restocking Fee 20% restocking fee will be charged for all cancelled orders

Site Preparation Customer is required to supply all conduit and cable pulls not listed on this quote.
Customer will be responsible for any additional wiring or installation supplies needed
during installation.

Training BIS Digital will provide full training of all system users per agreed training schedule.

Limited Warranty All BIS supplied new systems (Hardware & Software) are covered for 90 days following
date of installation/delivery. Warranty does not cover On-Site Technical Support,
Shipping costs, or Software upgrades (See Software Assurance below).

This signature and Purchase Order number states acceptance to the above price, terms and conditions, authorizing
BIS Digital, Inc. to order, install and bill for the above equipment:

* Accepted by:
Name Title

Signature Date

* Accounts Payable Information * Required for order to be processed*

A/P Contact:

Name Phone Number
Email Address Fax #
Is a Purchase Order required for processing? P.O#

1350 NE 56 Street ~Suite 300 - Fort Lauderdale, FL 33434 - Fax: {877) 858-5611
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